

**Tabulation of Bids**  
**County of Ware**  
**Waycross, Georgia 31501**

**Sealed Bids:** **Bulk Oil**  
**Date of Opening:** **May 10, 2011**  
**Department:** **Vehicle Maint**

**Invitations Extended: 8 Invitations Received: 2**

**Bennett Oil Company**  
**Waycross, GA 31502**

**Fletcher Oil**  
**Douglas, GA 31533**

**Fuel South, Inc.**  
**Waycross, GA 31503**

**Jim Hinton Oil**  
**Valdosta, GA 31601**

**Lewis & Raulerson**  
**Waycross, GA 31502**

**Ocean Petroleum Co**  
**Brunswick, GA 31520**

Item	Description	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
	<b>SAE 15W40</b>	11.88/Gallon	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	13.99/Gallon
	<b>SAE 10W30</b>	2.57/Quart	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3.25/Quart
	<b>SAE 10W20</b>	2.57/Quart	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	No Bid
	<b>SAE 5W20</b>	2.57/Quart	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3.25/Quart
	<b>SAE 5W30</b>	2.57/Quart	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3.25/Quart
	<b>SAE 20W50</b>	2.57/Quart	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3.25/Quart
	<b>GEAR OIL</b>	55.30/Bucket	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
	<b>MULTIPURPOSE GREASE</b>	2.25/Tube	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	2.60/Tube
	<b>HYDRAULIC FLUID-TRACTOR</b>	38.85/Bucket	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
	<b>AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID</b>	12.75/Bucket	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	14.08/Bucket
	<b>DRIVE TRAIN FLUID</b>	11.80/Gallon	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	13.03/Gallon
	<b>EXTENDED LIFE ANTIFREEZE</b>	8.35/Gallon	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	9.98/Gallon
	<b>ANTIFREEZE</b>	7.50/Gallon	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	8.95/Gallon
	<b>PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT</b>	N/A	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	N/A
	<b>BRAND</b>	Conoco Phillips					Various

COMMENTS:

Prepared By: [Elizabeth Hope](#)

Awarded By:

**Tabulation of Bids**  
**County of Ware**  
**Waycross, Georgia 31501**

**Sealed Bids:** **Bulk Oil**  
**Date of Opening:** **May 10, 2011**  
**Department:** **Vehicle Maint**

**Invitations Extended: 8    Invitations Received:**

**Perry Brothers Oil**  
**Americus, GA 31709**

**T&R Oil**  
**Waycross, GA 31502**

Item	Description	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
	<b>SAE 15W40</b>	NO BID	NO BID				
	<b>SAE 10W30</b>	NO BID	NO BID				
	<b>SAE 10W20</b>	NO BID	NO BID				
	<b>SAE 5W20</b>	NO BID	NO BID				
	<b>SAE 5W30</b>	NO BID	NO BID				
	<b>SAE 20W50</b>	NO BID	NO BID				
	<b>GEAR OIL</b>	NO BID	NO BID				
	<b>MULTIPURPOSE GREASE</b>	NO BID	NO BID				
	<b>HYDRAULIC FLUID-TRACTOR</b>	NO BID	NO BID				
	<b>AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID</b>	NO BID	NO BID				
	<b>DRIVE TRAIN FLUID</b>	NO BID	NO BID				
	<b>EXTENDED LIFE ANTIFREEZE</b>	NO BID	NO BID				
	<b>ANTIFREEZE</b>	NO BID	NO BID				
	<b>PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT</b>	NO BID	NO BID				

COMMENTS:

Prepared By: [Elizabeth Hope](#)

Awarded By: